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The Roaring 1990s: 

Déjà Vu All Over Again? 
______________________________ 

 
Check out the accompanying chart collection.  
  
Executive Summary: Many of this decade’s economic and financial market trends bear a striking 
resemblance to those of the 1990s. That was a decade in which a stock market meltup preceded a 
meltdown (in the early 2000s), so monitoring meltup indicators today is well worthwhile. Now, as then, 
stock market strength is translating to significant wealth effects that should keep the economy resilient 
and monetary policy restrictive for longer. Today, we highlight the two periods’ similar economic 
conditions (comparing the trajectories of real GDP growth, productivity growth, inflation, unemployment, 
and the federal funds rate) and financial market paths (bond yields, the stock market). … Also: Dr. Ed 
reviews “The Zone of Interest” (+ + +). 

______________________________ 
YRI Weekly Webcast. Join Dr. Ed’s live webcast with Q&A on Mondays at 11 a.m. EST. 
You will receive an email with the link one hour before showtime. Replays of the weekly 
webcasts are available here. 
  
Strategy: The Roaring 1990s vs the Roaring 2020s. Since the start of the 2020s, we’ve 
been comparing the current decade mostly to the 1920s and the 1970s. However, the S&P 
500’s 42.3% meltup since October 12, 2022 to a new record high on February 23 has us 
considering whether another period represents a possible analogous scenario, i.e., the 
second half of the 1990s. We see parallels between conditions then and now that may 
suggest what’s up ahead for both the stock market and the federal funds rate (FFR). 
  
Leading the S&P 500 higher back then was the Nasdaq 100 (Fig. 1 and Fig. 2). That seems 
to be happening again since the ratio of the latter to the former bottomed on January 5, 
2023 (Fig. 3). We are especially intrigued by the similarity between the recent vertical 
ascent of Nvidia’s stock price and that of Cisco’s stock price during the late 1990s (Fig. 4). 
  
Indeed, Melissa and I are considering the possibility that the second half of the 1990s’ script 
might be the most likely scenario for the FFR over the rest of the current decade. Back then, 
stock prices soared. The positive wealth effect boosted economic growth. Inflation was 

https://yardeni.com/wp-content/uploads/cc_20240226.pdf
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3mXW4MBSKc327mHLW8ZBMfP4twvgTW3YdgJH6Cd5lzW5383xN4YygRbW8brVCj29_9-MW1ZdGnm73SlR2N11BjDqyLlJWVS3Njh30XZcRW1G8K0f1hGjnhW4NMQVt8fPDBNW8FTMvK7QY1LTW7W8bnC7Tw7lwW1X1nJc2Gz41LW1zvBhX5vBPDYV8k84T85bQ22W1hV5zy6L4XtlW2pD_Nt8B4jk3Vbqpvg3w3QlvVnJb6c1D0SCLW5TBR2f7jj3CQN1bQqDJ14RRZN3fyv7_SypgJW4s2mXr2C4lgrW7hVmL57BRxR0f4gCjXb04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3p0W7GKhLg92mF0WW5cr7_76_sbSqW1WtJNb5pp4sLW7jmLT38NQdHgW1zVw9p5dCJQ5VdzFhc3qzV_8W8_6MfB2CqZZjW6pWFlD7jYh7bW28h0mh4kHFw6N7Dj8H3h9WV-W1cFHnX7qFxrDN1Cl2yPh78fgW3BrMh56PddRhV4glj68wPjGgN26jVDZ7n7H4W1Tt6SR3WFQtNW49RlqX6xh74rW7JKC7k7CZmCWW5G5LT47kkb7gW5XYmq25Dl5X9N3zf3f9gVc7qW35vJv73SgYjWW3N3p-C5qFjZrW16p-Yw3kCPlxf49DSWH04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3kGW1qMl247TRzSvW4kN2s28WNFtWW2mxVMY65jxSmW9gzsmW1HGW77N7JH2D1zcdy8W4F0yPb7-FNlMW6dZD6s4LnkyLW1-KKLQ3V4lC1VwqKkk5LJwTxW4-Gqw62-j4jYW5rtTm77rX-tDW60Ykff6yDkJYW5Vbjk27QG-4xV2rqDz6LjMgZW1_Y_HN44RRbqN3hlcHSXxzY9W2Y7p9Z2nr7PsW7p3RX93fnjSPN99GKp1xMGlMW6QsSVr8GcPTdN7CHrTFQZMfdW29pNnL8tBb_YW8tYQp-8Hgyr1W6b9J9b8QNG8Lf6v_x_b04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3kTW5_hvpk96dcy8W5S6wwS8-xmMJV8v47b92ZgJWW4-xyf95CcnT3W4-xY--2F8PK2N7QlrL5nKnkTW1xxJxW4jQ2KQVjV-l_28dgSjW5CP3P76_F48bW8Rnkmk4ynrPdN1NLkTHMZW7JW3G7y1G2DHGy7W6zyzVm1V-nLHW3d5nrw32lv7MW1H7s4M5NVtL_W1CRHS693HFW3W1drFp948vhfMW32M8sN2Kc3gMN2Lfp_yZ4xCmW7Txb4v3RTT6YW2CkJbN3FcFVBW1j1tWk6N5V1vW8dJRKD6vcZRzW46HCDg8ynygQf32NQx-04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3kyW2xmk6m4gWz4yW75TDXn7LVh-ZW6kqH806vGC7BW2RrShD72f_60W4WRKXw8zGz9YW88HJYt1b3y0bW3p1h-V7613lvW6FdW8k2L97M3W7WVm_S13n2hyVTBT3n81F8XzW8P9fNj5b__lBW7z3v0W7Z0nCLW1rDnZn4GmX0-W56MX_s6s2dnsW2xtF002tbYQcW1xH3zz1NNq4PW3K0N__6l39h0W1Kc37Y35GRNbW2p59hx5bR1fKVw6-Kv7cLnsvW4BNf9N8HnWXBVbh5bJ1BdsfvW3pcmZ910dJvlW1tGdCt5p-G4tf7bdjLK04
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subdued by rapid productivity growth, implying that the inflation adjusted FFR was in line 
with the so-called "neutral" FFR. Consider the following: 
  
(1) Real GDP. The 1990s started with a brief and shallow recession (Fig. 5). Real GDP 
growth rebounded quickly from a low of -1.0% y/y during Q1-1991 to its historical average of 
3.1%. During the second half of the decade, it fluctuated around 4.0%-5.0%. 
  
The current decade started out with a brief but severe recession because of the pandemic 
lockdown in early 2020. It was followed by a very strong recovery. By Q4-2023, real GDP 
was back to the 3.1% historical average growth rate. Debbie and I expect to see real GDP 
growing at or above this rate through the end of the decade thanks to solid productivity 
growth. 
  
(2) Productivity. The growth rate of nonfarm business productivity was very volatile during 
the first half of the 1990s (Fig. 6). It soared to 5.0% y/y during Q1-1992. Then it plunged to -
0.6% during Q4-1993. During the second half of the decade, it was back over its historical 
average of 2.0%. It peaked at 4.2% by the end of the decade. 
  
During the first half of the current decade, productivity growth has also fluctuated widely, 
from 6.8% during Q3-2020 to -2.4% during Q2-2022. But it was back above its historical 
average at 2.7% at the end of last year. In our Roaring 2020s scenario, we are expecting a 
productivity growth boom during the second half of the current decade much like the one 
during the second half of the 1990s. 
  
(3) Inflation. In addition to boosting the growth rate of real GDP, productivity (along with 
hourly compensation) determines unit labor costs (ULC)—the y/y percent change of which 
is the underlying inflation rate. is the underlying inflation rate. Both ULC and CPI inflation 
rates fell significantly during the first half of the 1990s (Fig. 7). The former dropped from 
5.1% in Q4-1990 to -0.2% in Q2-1994. Over this same period, the CPI inflation rate declined 
from 6.3% to 2.3%. Over the remainder of the decade, it fell to a low of 1.4% in March 1998 
and ended the decade at 2.7%. 
  
In our Roaring 2020s scenario, CPI inflation continues to moderate along with ULC inflation 
as productivity growth continues to improve. ULC inflation was down to 2.3% y/y during Q4-
2023 from 6.3% during Q1-2022. If productivity growth climbs to 3.5%-4.5% over the rest of 
this decade, as we expect, that would boost the growth rate of real GDP while keeping a 
tight lid on inflation. 
  

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3nsW3lLJnd3r5h4zW57CG-T1VhbFtW9j4Q851pr0bNW579qXP69yQXSW8Bvxg86zkdBSW1_C2R-18-hD1W46Y9LY4YlyPgW9kQTWk7MR1N6W2RC_Zr1JGQfwW8QQKCL6sC4hmN8JV7BtzD3tlW78Wh4T30-z4ZW5X849-4wHLWHW6G2QC_8cdW8bW3sjbwG5Vm87yW2n7X3m31PgJQN1h98cVCPs6pV9x4Wn4vgYk-W1tddvR7FgzrVW4Hyq2d2sKsnBW1NtDlf1zYYTCW8_nCsy16mCzBW8g08rW8-DS2CN68VTYPJjSX7f7GPHh604
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3pLW6RdwSm3l659LW4HcP_p1J32gxW15fk1Z2Y3-XZN6Jyl__44B9dW1q-Snk6FY8DkVxKWhK3FRJMCW435V8N2JWfdFN4nY825QKWGDW8Kq4-c70VGBSW6yZSzZ4trFlhW7KDc5m2HcKSTW4PJybC8qnn5MW8sKWCH7brWN0W5-9Bv296hCP6VL461p94GmC2W2Fvply60ttQLMHSjDgYmvhgW6_zFdp3_gCvxW6ny-Tv5FWkQcW5FBXpv85qQB1W8jnBft4LqxLhVKdB036qzJT0W42SDcQ6ZmLXkW5cvhNl5NxMhTf3tsZ5q04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3p1W6MZrgq21w46DW1jvRrH3X5V0JW1N_XC75-CNvYW5Bp3GJ53100mN1rwQylBWhj_W2b9cVq4_Q_MBW6Gxcj54gScCsW3g5Sqw57MzdMW4GXGzl40f_rkW6GqPnY76_k5cW10dbDq6RyG-pN8BzW1Kgz7TSW1qdKm63p80f1W1r9k0K27Z0VlW24nqRq4vwm8bW4X9PVN5Mdr8WW7p0k4Q2kxjRyW1T-Dg65B4kXmW2Dg9Kj2HFlKZW6b07L41qFncfW1xs6HP8zHYMfW4ylyKw2BgsVWVCNrvs53vFzzVSzJ3w8vB20qf2wngWs04
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(4) Unemployment. During the 1990s, the unemployment rate rose from 5.4% during 
January 1990 to a peak of 7.8% in June 1992 (Fig. 8). It then trended downward throughout 
the rest of the decade, finishing the decade at 4.0%. 
  
The jobless rate troughed at 3.5% at the start of the current decade. It spiked to 14.8% 
during the pandemic lockdown. It was back under 4.0% at the end of 2021 and has 
remained below this level through January of this year. 
  
So the labor market is already tighter than it was during the late 1990s. We’ve previously 
observed that there is an inverse correlation between the unemployment rate and the trend 
growth rate of productivity (Fig. 9). That makes sense: When labor is hard to find, 
businesses have an incentive to boost the productivity of their employees. 
  
That describes the current situation, in our opinion, which is why we expect that businesses 
will continue to invest in productivity enhancing technologies. Today’s technologies have far 
more potential to boost both brawn and brain productivity than ever before, and far more 
businesses than ever before will need that boost given the tight condition of the labor 
market. And just by happenstance, such brawn and brain technologies are more useful and 
affordable for almost all sorts of businesses than ever before. 
  
(5) Federal funds rate. The federal funds rate fell from about 8.00% at the start of the 1990s 
to around 3.00% during 1993 (Fig. 10). It rose during 1994 and peaked at 6.30% on March 
31, 1995. It then ranged mostly between 5.00% and 6.00% for the rest of the 1990s. 
  
Back then, the economy was doing well as productivity growth improved. The 
unemployment rate was falling. Inflation was subdued. That could very well describe the 
rest of the current decade. If so, then perhaps the FFR will indeed stay higher (i.e., 5.25%-
5.50%) for much longer (i.e., through the end of the decade)! 
  
Yes, but what about the real FFR? Isn’t it already too restrictive? If inflation continues to 
moderate, as we expect, the real FFR will rise and be even more restrictive. To avert a 
recession from such tightening, won’t the Fed have to lower the FFR? 
  
First, for the record, we question the relevance of a real FFR, which adjusts an overnight 
bank borrowing rate with a y/y inflation rate. The disparate time frames make it a very odd 
concept, to say the least. 
  
In any event, the FFR is currently 2.24% (Fig. 11). The economy had no problems with real 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3plW4jWW7j1yShZVN8zH0d5FbqbFW4CHyQ260chdSW1nRXXl5m-skBW79YQ_n2jhVsFW8WMt4v1dY3cqW8n-LRQ6dqCZ9W73Q_xj4dStWGW94jbPZ7kM0cRW2XLgNw2cPhyRVndmxP7W3tJSW1SB1zT7BnJr9W9dVN2X4PmMfKW8Hyb0x6rwcHTW3p7W0Y1zxHtMW16MpbL2v9bkqW39WNfN2hY9Q_W1dpTDK3FwPBnW2hD_t73DLpSrV2zN5y3kKcR6W3NP8FN3K-48HW3cCx4c5BYrkdW90msJR7kPtm9W6v4DlT3RJ6ZJf6snS8x04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3ldW3HQm7v8sNsxYW6RSy5B2z5FrLW90023x1XZ6WlW8TT31S1mTTGZW4Mf7x-9fMkm-W19n5zm20FtsZTthk62v6Mm0W19X_m-43lrLbW2F_Rj_1FLzzjW24zlVm4qwJLKW8Cd1MR6_5jylV7rtGw7HGz3cW1G4xpB5j1wZsW1-MsxJ58F4jvW7XpWnk2Bbmq8W2LT46L7z80qqW7cfVg23PCpL5W6Lm6bv7sb99-W6lTzZq1wwNZFW9dlzNK1jd0bCN66ZSNr9W2CxW2gZVyx88HSJdW1mT5wR74DKlkW7qFqr553-Rsdf4G7sR004
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3lNW36jsJ_8kmf8LW4PrfnH7HrH3pVg58Gj4FZHdZN850ZJNbWql1W4S71QL157rGkW1kgWlr5v42cNW6SYxms8f5zv1W7RcFWC5thp1XW66LQvh1dBsjbW5Mk-RZ7_5rG9W3kd15L1HKV7lW2Jcn2Q4fQRlwW5ZpzvG1zFWRfN9836-T5vl3hW1T6Tcg3FJLXGW1N3cnh5WHq60W5LjZhZ39h4nyW4XRXJQ5kS9N8W3CFc5B1szp10W1KXjpY4p3DDVW1__C4v243k_3W6f_LJC6C1tN0W6HYNml5fQYw-N30BNVxLJwcpf3XrbkP04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3q6W6QMmDB3218rFW5JSzJH18sb_JW6bbL6-1vLs_ZVq4dRr4_NGMkW6BtWzL3ZcJ3QW66RVbC8Ng8JxW4Vsh-N96cRr5W1b1W4V3pX3mKW86kc7f61L-SsW417mYb4Rz-wpW7CWH5T8TYFRBW1l114q5gDt5_N3GcMRDGlqgTW193sz548dXwWW1g7bD_4dKG1gW6F20W02fNr_DW6-5XqV82YwyLW42Xwmg2Gc9v9W9ktP-D39mqBDW6-QsbK1YTMy6W6VKQR04rlbpJW66-YcW8Ns3r9W73-HQf2t9_Q8N4gRk5RFTSzMf6QJcWR04
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FFRs ranging between 2.00% and 4.00% during the second half of the 1990s. Perhaps, the 
same is likely to happen over the remainder of this decade. It’s happened before, so it could 
happen again, especially since the economic environment seems quite similar. 
  
(6) Bond yields. While the concept of a real FFR seems odd to us, we have no problem with 
the real bond yield, i.e., the 10-year US Treasury bond yield less the CPI inflation rate on a 
y/y basis (Fig. 12). It happens to track the 10-year TIPS yield quite well. 
  
During the 1990s, the real bond yield fluctuated in a flat range between a low of 2.0% 
(December 1990) and a high of 5.3% (November 1994). It is currently 1.0%. If inflation 
continues to fall to 2.0%, while the nominal bond yield remains around 4.0% (because the 
Fed keeps the FFR higher for much longer than expected), then the real bond yield would 
double to 2.0%. That would still be below the real bond yields of the 1990s, when the 
economy performed perfectly well! 
  
(7) Stock market. If this is the 1990s all over again, are we in 1994 or are we closer to 
1999? We aren’t sure. However, we are sure that, as occurred during the second half of the 
1990s, the stock market is having a significantly positive wealth effect on the economy now 
that the major stock market indexes are at record highs. That’s another reason to believe 
that the economy will remain resilient and another reason why the Fed might hesitate to 
lower the FFR for a while—maybe a long while. 
  
The value of all stocks traded in the US rose fivefold during the 1990s from $4 trillion to $20 
trillion (Fig. 13). It is currently up fourfold above that level to about $80 trillion. 
  
(8) Bottom line. The Roaring 1990s was a decade with lots of similarities to the Roaring 
1920s. The 2020s seem to be following a similar script. Both the 1920s and the 1990s 
ended with stock market meltups that were followed by meltdowns. 
  
So we continue to monitor meltup indicators. That includes analysts’ consensus 
expectations for S&P 500 long-term earnings growth (LTEG) (Fig. 14). It is up sharply from 
last year’s low of 9.0% during the April 11 week to 14.7% currently. That’s a big jump 
reflecting upward revisions in the long-term prospects for the growth rate of the MegaCap-8 
companies (i.e., Alphabet, Amazon, Apple, Meta, Microsoft, Netflix, Nvidia, and Tesla) 
following great earnings reports by some of them recently (Fig. 15). The LTEG of the 
MegaCap-8 is up from 13.4% during the January 31, 2023 week to 38.9% during the 
February 23, 2024 week. Nevertheless, the overall LTEG is still well below previous meltup 
peaks. 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3m-W7xYCTh8rY-l5W2gz7qT820d7nM7y6TdgLk_jW8hCqKG8KSt4NW1b7Hn72D6DprV_Nc8H7z4TS0W4yNj9F2MWStGW53NDGZ378dCzV47PPD1_d7nnW2qb0lx1tnZxGW3s94h_47zMjbW2KsCRR3HxqwqW8R1w9f4H569PW5SV9L54xKJf_N3kh8n_ZHC7bW1nR7wn8KgxTgW39f_xb8t86WgW84DS7W3PMsqFW6TsgXT8zwBKyW2Pqfnj22F2bwW7Dxnlz1h0FC_W58jBHS9cjqvgV6ntsx3NyCvTW1zff2D30BlyGd6wPqd04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3mGN8dnFpktX_tyW7YyCNj1-hGJyW51W20F1KQGQpW9kq8tx371wZWW4RnC-k51L9cPW4HQvSp5xxpc9W8HhCJF1m-wkfW8mC-JP4wH-F4W7w6zRH7qlZXLW9kHBK724BdNNW1zVrwL5skNSdW7T_TfW2k2WwfW4PBQTF1TmSpbVcXQ8J7qsTg2W7Z9ccf3Wxj3vW7Gbf6H5K0s0fW8_G01B2G_ZLfW2RbfMZ3ZldpsV8H6Yz6vfzmyW9gY5ry8zXW0vW2VhCp592xfNRW4kVrF_4YCrXwN8ffKw1fVXz6W6_9K7h5Jr6VXf7J3gR804
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3mHW4T6XMv70GXt9W25jZ_05mfxjYW6zT0wl2XymbfW4pdhFW4jdgVvW39wDvP4ZPZJPW5gpyrY8cBXDtW6Kh4DT17jHnJW1BlT0J1gJNfhW2_2Hyz8JKHvFW7KmpHV4xzL4CN44Zt49bVg9qW6hs3Q343NycFW7xCGFd2N1tvjW3ScR824Gnf_fW55n_YZ6tySlQW2V9Fyf29D45WW4MzGCr6Ng_NXW4fzh_d41MslVW7F2HSY5VJCXWW2pnNM57rpQNVW6dZ7hs80L84gW2b9xr97zzypdW6jnqFN6g4hW_W2L4PT-98zg81f1R8Z0-04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3nlW4ZbxBG2qW8T_W2vT59845nMcsVg5r-_4Q1zXjW2gKW9T2Cb5g-W6lq8zY3lLLLtW3X5-H71sYGKxW495DM54CHqkCW69LxMc5pz5zTN6sv-1kj34gYW6qfVsr5nrXLlW65vrVY30-Tb-VsYk5k7hrH7MW2glry34KLcDNW33cJhg2Cpgr9W430S4R98lkl1W6vlv964q_dhbW3cjHVF6DwvzyW4WhN4P42rt5mW4pfHYl36VpBZVnXzf85kGR1NV61yr48thxFXW4mv7Cw8m63-WW7L5FjZ1h-Y0wV9tF_Q16-Rk7f51Zj9F04
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At the same time, we are on alert for a repeat of the 1970s’ twin inflation peaks caused by 
the decade’s two energy crises. This concern focuses us on the price of a barrel of Brent 
crude oil, which remains remarkably subdued in light of the conflicts in the Middle East (Fig. 
16). 
  
Movie. “The Zone of Interest” (+ + +) (link) is a remarkable film about the banality of evil. 
The film focuses on SS soldier Rudolf Hoss, the commandant of the Auschwitz 
concentration camp, and his family. They live in a very nice house surrounded by a high 
wall that doesn’t completely hide the adjoining death camp nor the fire and smoke spewed 
by its chimneys. Beyond the wall, the air is also filled with the sounds of gunshots, barking 
dogs, and prisoners screaming in terror and pain. Meanwhile, Mrs. Hoss happily tends to 
her large garden, while the kids enjoy their swimming pool. Mr. Hoss works hard to impress 
his superiors with the efficiency of his horrible crematory furnaces. Steven Spielberg praised 
the movie as the best Holocaust movie since his own (“Schindler’s List,” 1993), highlighting 
its impact on raising awareness. Unfortunately, raising awareness of this historical horror is 
needed more than ever today. 

 

Calendars 
  
US: Mon: Dallas Fed Manufacturing Index; New Home Sales 680k; Building Permits 
1.47mu;  Tues: Consumer Confidence 114.0; Richmond Fed Manufacturing Index -4; 
 Durable Goods Orders Total & Nondefense Capital Goods Orders ex Aircraft -4.5%/0.1%; 
S&P/CS HPI Composite Index 6.0%y/y; Atlanta Fed GDPNow 2.9% (Q1); API Weekly 
Crude Oil Inventories. (FXStreet estimates) 
  
Global: Mon: UK CBI Distributive Trade Surveys -33; Lagarde; Nagel; Balz; Mauderer; Pill; 
Breeden; Ramsden. Tues: Germany Gfk Consumer Climate -28.5; France Consumer 
Confidence. (FXStreet estimates) 

 

Strategy Indicators 
  
Global Stock Markets (US$ Performance) (link): The US MSCI index hit a new record 
high for a fifth straight week after trading below its prior (December 27, 2021) record high 
for 25 months. It rose 1.6% for the week and has posted gains in 15 of the past 17 weeks. 
The AC World ex-US index rose 1.3% to a 23-month high, but remains in a 10.6% 

      
 

      
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3nNVZWjjj3ylMrYM-1tX9QjZ6TW3wvTW-2wpqn4W2LDFrC4jj0xgW2pCCgc6j5MfvW7BH-l93R7B5jW4FbZhb89nzz8W9d5hK21VP2yzW5hQFP87HWmzrN8bYQZM6xWN4W2qKZnq2BZ6ZBW4HDxnn63F61bW5lBLSm5NJP_BN4zx0C49_8_GW6ds1Wc68Vq3CN9k5D2BBxyQCW5dyJFh680B2GW96lzKm5LPX2qW5rXR578Ks4jXW1n2J_c3S05WnVqbTx_6DPDf2W81Wy0t4nXf53W17RnhZ8JHrhVW2-cks96gtWwwf4M0Zml04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3nNVZWjjj3ylMrYM-1tX9QjZ6TW3wvTW-2wpqn4W2LDFrC4jj0xgW2pCCgc6j5MfvW7BH-l93R7B5jW4FbZhb89nzz8W9d5hK21VP2yzW5hQFP87HWmzrN8bYQZM6xWN4W2qKZnq2BZ6ZBW4HDxnn63F61bW5lBLSm5NJP_BN4zx0C49_8_GW6ds1Wc68Vq3CN9k5D2BBxyQCW5dyJFh680B2GW96lzKm5LPX2qW5rXR578Ks4jXW1n2J_c3S05WnVqbTx_6DPDf2W81Wy0t4nXf53W17RnhZ8JHrhVW2-cks96gtWwwf4M0Zml04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2z3qn9gW6N1vHY6lZ3pvW74Dd8v93QTF8W6splZc8dDK4-W5gW_JR5VCmcTV20z3d4njHHjW1W6Pm573wFz0W57zCt22v__9gVbs6fg6GhC-cW5BHQB53Qsq19W4Xvg5963_2ZbW3bndjB27RrsWW7LWDx87jGzB1W9l1WGT1DNlRvW5VQWy72zsNfzW4V5C-t2dN941W6V4wwW92G20LVF6b5H5_Wgp1W9chccC9b78KfW6xrSHc4X2knTW7NZkx04NvxClW1jDt5q77M1vJW6sqld732kg7YW5NqPNg7qd4D7f73fFBK04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_383qn9gW7Y8-PT6lZ3p3W6D30pz6Bh-jLW5MgBT_57NCWJW659H2v924Q9WV57sLm9l5n2BW26r4W06l0xCQW6g5HSK1-sCJ0W7ZDt5Q1WxZZQW1VkZks3tvzy-W5tjPwC1g2jKSMHQSMgjLdgFW5wRYGB2TJdQVMR9JZ4qc9f7VfwK1Z3h1s0kW8nPFvD2b_nYrN5RlWxRY1jK8W7c5PhK8V9z6vN4_LPf5w-5q4W4pCQ2362M1ZPW3LJ-BF6JTjpHW4kFv_c92n_2fW6C9fx_83d6D_W5Cnm2c3pphDgW40GLHg80SL6HW8kNdYG2zKbk8N2LkSBbGdTdrW6hLSmn8Gwrvhf8Gc-zH04
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correction from its June 15, 2021 record high. EMU was the best performer among the 
regions that we follow with a gain of 2.2%, followed by Europe (1.6%), EM Asia (1.6), and 
EAFE (1.4). EM Latin America was the worst regional performer last week with a decline of 
0.7%, followed by EMEA (0.3) and EM (1.2). Among the major selected country markets 
that we follow, Spain performed the best last week, with a gain of 3.1%, followed by France 
(3.0), China (2.7), Sweden (2.6), and Germany (2.2). The worst country performers last 
week: South Africa (-1.9), Mexico (-1.4), Brazil (-0.2), Australia (0.5), and the United 
Kingdom (0.7). The 6.5% ytd gain for the MSCI United States remains well ahead of the AC 
World ex-US index (1.6). EMU’s ytd gain of 3.4% puts it ahead of EAFE (2.3), Europe (1.8), 
and the AC World ex-US. The worst performing regions so far in 2024: EM Latin America (-
4.8), EM (0.4), EM Asia (1.0), and EMEA (1.1). Looking at the major selected country 
markets that we follow, the United States and Japan are the best ytd performers with gains 
of 6.5%, followed by India (6.1), Taiwan (4.2), France (3.1), and Germany (1.6). The worst 
performing countries so far in 2024: South Africa (-10.2), Brazil (-5.7), Hong Kong (-4.6), 
Korea (-3.2), and Mexico (-3.0).   
  
US Stock Indexes (link): Thirty-eight of the 48 major US stock indexes that we follow rose 
last week, up from 29 rising a week earlier. The S&P 400 MidCap Pure Growth index was 
the best performer with a gain of 2.8%, ahead of S&P 500 Transportation (2.1%), Dow 
Jones 20 Transports (1.9), S&P 500 LargeCap Growth (1.9), and S&P 100 MegaCap (1.8). 
The S&P 600 SmallCap Pure Value index was the worst performer with a decline of 1.6%, 
followed by S&P 600 Value (-1.3), S&P 600 SmallCap Equal Weighted (-1.1), Russell 2000 
Value (-1.0), and Russell 2000 (-0.8). Looking at their ytd performances, 38 of the 48 
indexes are higher so far. The S&P 400 MidCap Pure Growth index is the best performer so 
far in 2024 with a gain of 11.8%, follow by S&P 500 LargeCap Growth index (9.9), Russell 
1000 Growth (9.1), Russell 3000 Growth (8.8), and S&P 500 LargeCap Pure Growth (8.7). 
The worst performing major US stock indexes ytd: S&P 600 SmallCap Pure Value (-4.4), 
S&P 400 MidCap Pure Value (-4.3), S&P 600 SmallCap Value (-4.2), Dow Jones 15 Utilities 
(-3.7), Russell 2000 Value (-3.0), and S&P 600 SmallCap Equal Weighted (-3.0). 
  
S&P 500 Sectors Performance (link): All 11 S&P 500 sectors rose last week, and four 
outperformed the S&P 500’s 1.7% gain. That compares to seven sectors rising a week 
earlier and eight ahead of the composite index’s 0.4% decline. Consumer Staples was the 
best weekly performer, with a gain of 2.1%, followed by Information Technology (2.0%), 
Materials (1.9), and Industrials (1.8). Energy was the worst performer, albeit with a gain of 
0.4%, followed by Real Estate (0.9) Utilities (1.2), Communication Services (1.5), Health 
Care (1.5), Consumer Discretionary (1.5), and Financials (1.6). The S&P 500 is up 6.7% ytd 
with nine of the 11 sectors in positive territory and four ahead of the index. Communication 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_383qn9gW7Y8-PT6lZ3mKW7J2r0f6bmN_ZW4x8tVl3_6vTvW8CXKk033k8cMW8W66PS6mH-5bMYQnmmjYlQ8N8R837qkgngWW3tfPxk7FPXP3W3QgGtw40n5drW367Gf235-bt8W6p8XrH1P2_0vW1Wqzz16MFBBKW32Klnw8-WZWSW1nm1ym13FNNmW13xp0370mcYCW8rXTyK4HrJvjW2tb9kv6s3b6bN4blXgw8Cb82Vk05cC7-CXthV2B-B34BJ2YHW56dlrN3vczX_W73-Jqj68ZBNLW9fqnvZ70R2j6W21l6KV1clNWbW4qtD333mCl53W52mjWY3zn-J_VyY_Cb4dDGRlf4WXPcT04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_383qn9gW7Y8-PT6lZ3pjW6QkNRV1Jcb_2W4Pq-hm74CzsFW45pmcC419pBmVGfv6r110kW2W51qvpL5kQyMKW2LpY0v2M-DKrW3dsT0k4dN_z8N177mmy8bDBHVWwBzt2_dfVDW8kFLBT1gb18_VyRw522T5wJQW13nHfj9gvGvVW6y4Hg823ZwL3W35FKQF3mDVc4MbZNx83TWz0W4TFJj34-TXCVW3kMNTT1k60wPW41Nxl949hWFZW52QWc46tKzdJW3m88px8GF3pwW1FSRpJ1nP6fTVSWg5w2CCswLW6q-ZzD5Y8ntmW326-vS7rfsp4W7qG4MK2XDJLzW7PsLkw5zG5J4f7Sw68004
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Services is the best ytd performer with a gain of 11.7%, ahead of Information Technology 
(9.6), Health Care (8.2), and Financials (6.8). These sectors are lagging the S&P 500 so far 
in 2024: Real Estate (-3.4), Utilities (-2.6), Materials (1.3), Energy (1.9), Consumer 
Discretionary (3.0), Consumer Staples (4.0), and Industrials (5.3). 

 

US Economic Indicators 
  
Existing Home Sales (link): “While home sales remain sizably lower than a couple of years 
ago, January’s monthly gain is the start of more supply and demand,” noted Lawrence Yun, 
NAR’s chief economist. He went on to say, “Listings were modestly higher, and home 
buyers are taking advantage of lower mortgage rates compared to late last year.” Existing 
home sales rose for the third month, by a solid 3.1% in January and 3.9% over the period to 
4.00mu (saar), up from its recent low of 3.85mu. Sales fell 1.7% y/y, though declines are on 
a steep narrowing trend. Single-family sales jumped 3.4% to 3.60mu (saar) last month—and 
was within 1.4% of a year ago—while multi-family sales were unchanged at 400,000 units 
(saar) in January but down 4.8% y/y. Regionally, existing home sales in January were a 
mixed bag, with only the West recording gains on both a monthly and yearly basis: West 
(4.3% m/m & 2.8% y/y. Sales increased during January in the South and Midwest and were 
flat in the Northeast—with all three in the red versus a year ago: South (4.0 & -1.6), 
 Midwest (2.2 & -3.1), and Northeast (0.0 & -5.9). Total housing inventory at the end of 
January was 1.01 million units, up 2.0% from December and 3.1% from last January’s 
980,000 units, with unsold inventory sitting at a 3.0 months’ supply at the current sales 
pace. The median price of an existing home for all housing types in January was $379,100, 
up 5.1% from January 2023—with all four US regions posting price increases.   

 

Global Economic Indicators 
  
US PMI Flash Estimates (link): Cost pressures continued to ease, according to February’s 
flash estimate report, while manufacturing activity accelerated and the service sector lost 
momentum during the month. The C-PMI slipped to 51.4 this month from 52.0 in January, 
though February’s rate of expansion was the second fastest since last July. The M-PMI (to 
51.5 from 50.7) improved to a 17-month high—as manufacturing output (52.3 from 49.3) 
swung from contraction to expansion and production increased on an improvement in 
supply chains following severe winter weather. Meanwhile, the NM-PMI (51.3 from 52.5) 
sank to a three-month low, though remained above the breakeven point of 50.0 for the 13th 

      
 

      
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_383qn9gW7Y8-PT6lZ3mbW1kztyD1WKFkyW5xT_TD3R-rrFW7lK79D1YP9p9W3bJG-P6JDQQBW6qfvq06HmPWXW6wx--J2pStMGW3cYmjB7twMSXW3SX5h-3RQTXBW6qP-8j6R4r4cW6VvNyR194KJBVv35S78gXbK0W7lvs0s37TcjNVGndCy2VMb0KW4g357Q7g_WRgV7ZdyV6kdnwrW37KmJ73-F5ZwW7Hdlj03wc4myW4b--Fp6R6zj6W7MhN5_5sJHQQW2DQhVW8Q8dpxF6g0frcPD-RW2Jt_Xl23DKwnW73w-7r8xtbzyW4wz_PZ7jLdz9W8z-BzV3535ZQVKL5P85ZLFTpf2zcrz804
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3pxN2JrL9qC__7HW696Pnl1wPGb_W5DPZ_J5DmqxHW5kKn288ywvhqW6C9Wv141bxmDW6QjVTM2K4MlvW7W9lph16WXZRW5Yk1bZ85r_5HW5bywrX4HswwxVlYB_-3r7ZS9N6_G3KRN-z9fW2yWbZ64sMMQKW6_0yKS1w4R8bN2qlM9X-VXZgTfZFf2rXkt9VdGZ2_3Z-hK3W61NQ212ffs7RW5h6RV04DmCprW8G3pp71nn38BW9c7G9D7M7YZ2W7F6SrM4M9DQHW3xwXcF1bLPVLW2pYf5L8mntkMW2vSwV6733xM8f1Bc3XK04
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successive month. Turning to pricing, average prices charged for goods fell from 56.9 in 
January to 55.0 this month—the lowest level since October 2020—while selling price 
inflation picked up slightly, though was the second slowest since mid-2020.    
  
Eurozone PMI Flash Estimates (link): “Eurozone downturn eases as service sector 
stabilizes, but price pressures intensify,” was the headline of February’s flash estimate 
report. The Eurozone’s C-PMI edged up from 47.9 in January to an eight-month high of 48.9 
in February, with the downturn continuing in the manufacturing sector, while the service 
sector steadied. The manufacturing sector contracted for the 11th straight month in 
February, with the rate of decline accelerating again, slipping to a two-month low of 46.1 
from January’s nine-month high of 46.6 this month. Meanwhile, the NM-PMI climbed to a 
seven-month high of 50.0 this month, from 48.4 in January. Looking at the two largest 
Eurozone economies, Germany’s C-PMI edged down to a four-month low of 46.1 in 
February from 47.0 in January, with the NM-PMI rising to a two-month high of 48.2 from 
47.7 last month, while the M-PMI fell from 45.5 to a four-month low of 42.3, remaining 
entrenched in negative territory. France’s economy remained stuck in contractionary 
territory midway through Q1, though the downturn eased, with its C-PMI climbing to a nine-
month high of 47.7 this month from 44.6 last month and the output level declining at the 
slowest pace since May 2023, when the current contraction period began. The NM-PMI (to 
48.0 from 45.4) rose to an eight-month high, while the M-PMI (46.3 from 41.0) reached an 
11-month high during the month. In contrast, the rest of the region as a whole reported 
output growth for the second month in February, following declines over the prior five-month 
period—posting its largest monthly improvement since last May. Faster service growth was 
accompanied by a near stabilization of manufacturing output.  
  
Japan PMI Flash Estimates (link): “Private sector activity stagnates” is the headline of the 
latest report. The C-PMI output measure climbed from 50.0 in December to a four-month 
high of 51.5 at the start of this year, though it all but evaporated during February, slipping to 
50.3. The M-PMI (to 45.4 from 47.7) output measure shows manufacturing activity fell 
further into contractionary territory during February, while the NM-PMI (52.5 from 53.1) 
showed a slowing in service sector growth. The report notes, “One bright spot was the 
accelerated rise in employment, with the rate of job creation reaching and eight-month 
high.” That said, it was a mixed bag, with nearly all the growth driven by the service sector 
and manufacturers recording the steepest cuts in workforce numbers in just over three 
years. Turning to prices, price pressures faced by Japan’s manufacturers eased during 
February as the rate of input inflation slowed to a seven-month low, which contributed to the 
slowest rise in output charges since mid-2021.   
  

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3pRW1S0yvv8prDXkV1dkWv1DKYlhW2bsy1569ZQzZW7sL8sy8pGhM9W43rRG02hpGrvW99QTpx3MH5q_W6Jn2R62myQBbW11yRLR6tK8X1W1TXc9S1jY2p_W7vcZh19lX5BVW7z3z4m8b8XLgW4ZG7Wy4mzPjXW66Rk5x3-2qhGW66jNg96bPyhTW8HMPFq68_z7SW44sQNS3Q4x7mW7-JH_r1Xb8s3W6s2-9z217QnrW8DGwJr2KzNZgW13D4vx4TX19ZW1N_NRB35fnTdW8Cqt_f5wYf-RW1VS1q41CJpR9W54r-_Z4_PPH2dFRZqW04
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VXjkdr97vb-GW4Nw4vt61X_CtW48Yhp759YSNdN7Y8_2T3qn9gW7lCdLW6lZ3lgW8SdZ9x45yDdcN5PYDQJ6PrvRW6mHs_96Tn-K3W3mRyWP4ZM5dJW3tZh3R8lvfcgN8CcP7xdWQvSW8gFlBX2svGT3VQGFsG1lvjF7N1Bp1QsXDjLmW5HQll_7N2qGgN5htDFd_wWyQVTBQH_86HGJpN4m5Wzkj7dPwW59FY3s8zDhmyW3wL5tD3y_dz3M6hVj3dqqPDW3bDCZC4PvfF9W91C5lz3yX_XXW85wLkn4tkB2-W6TfL8Z1wgCrSW7N1GTQ72Rj7zW66_B_f8RC927W52CX6w2-g7mYW59Q6tq6F6Cw-f6PG1M404
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Germany Ifo Business Climate Index (link): “The German economy is stabilizing at a low 
level,” noted Ifo president Clemens Fuest. The business climate index edged up to 85.5 in 
February from 85.2 in January—which was the lowest level since May 2020. The 
expectations component (to 84.1 from 83.5) rose this month, while the current situation 
component was unchanged at 86.9, which was the lowest since July 2020. In 
manufacturing, the business climate index fell this month, as the assessment of the current 
situation fell to its lowest level since September 2020 and the expectations component 
remained pessimistic. Meanwhile, the service sector saw its business climate improve 
during the month, led by a more favorable opinion of current business, while expectations 
were still pessimistic though not as pessimistic as last month. Meanwhile, trade’s business 
climate sank further, with companies noticeably less satisfied with their current business 
situation, though expectations improved slightly. Construction’s business climate remains at 
a low level, though did show a slight uptick this month due to a more favorable assessment 
of the current situation. However, expectations dropped to their lowest level since 1991.  
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